
ITEM Best Uniform 
Center***

BSN Sports, 
LLC Cintas Read's Uniforms Styled Uniforms 

& More
$19.50 $25.99 $17.00 $26.10
$19.50 $25.99 $19.00 $28.80
$19.50 $25.99 $21.00 $32.40
$19.50 $20.99 $18.00 $26.10
$19.50 $20.99 $20.00 $28.80
$19.50 $20.99 $17.00 $32.40
$19.50 no bid $16.00 $24.30
$19.50 no bid $18.00 $27.00
$16.50 $19.99 $16.00 $24.30
$16.50 $19.99 $18.00 $27.00
$16.50 $19.99 $18.00 $28.80
$93.50 no bid $99.00 $140.00
$93.50 no bid $99.00 $140.00

QUOTE SUMMARY
School Nutrition Services Uniforms FY26

***Quote could not be accepted since it was unsigned and did not include the Terms & Conditions.
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